
Solicitation:

IFB-19-0004

OCSPO Tire Bid

Tredroc Tire Services

Line Item #1

10R22.5 Bridgestone R268 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 343.00$ Bridgestone  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Bridgestone R268 14 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$398.41 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements BS R268  $                                    275.00 10R225 G MARATHON RSA TL STEER Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Bridgestone R268 #000277

Line Item #2 - MULTI-AWARD

10R22.5 Bridgestone FS561 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 318.00$  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Bridgestone FS561 14 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$275.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Firestone FS61 14PLY  $                        275.00 10R225 G MARATHON RSA TL STEER Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:  Goodyear 

Endurance  RSA G

$320.00 Marathon RSA

Line Item #3

10R22.5 Bridgestone FS560 14 Ply Steer or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 298.00$  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Bridgestone FS560 14 

Ply Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$320.43 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Firestone 561  $                        320.00 10R225 G ENDURANCE RSA TL STEER Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other- Goodyear

Model Number:  Goodyear 

Marathon RSA G

$275.00 Yokohama 104ZR #74732

Line Item #4

10R22.5 Michelin XZE 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Michelin XZE 14 Ply 

Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  $                        320.00 10R225 G ENDURANCE RSA TL STEER Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #5 - MULTI-AWARD

10R22.5 Michelin XZE 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Michelin XZE 14 Ply 

Steer

UOM: EACH

$320.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements CAPITAL TIRE Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:  Goodyear 

Endurance RSA G

$320.00 Endurance RSA

Line Item #6 - MULTI-AWARD

10R22.5 Goodyear G661 HSA 14 Ply Steer 

UOM: EACH

NOTE:  G661 HAS BEEN DISCONTINUED

Unit Price   Brand Requirements 10R22.5 Goodyear G661 HSA 14 

Ply Steer  NOTE: G661 

discontinued, replaced with 

Endurance RSA G

UOM: EACH

$320.00 $320.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Unit Price  $                        385.00 10R225 UE G661 HAS TL G SF Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:       Marathon 

RSA G

$275.00 Endurance RSA

Jam Best One Fleet Service Jefferson The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company                        Belleville, 

Michigan location will service our districts.                         Akron, Ohio 

is the Corporate office.

1



Solicitation:
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Line Item #7 - MULTI-AWARD

10R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD 12 Ply Drive 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 421.00$  $                       325.00 GY G622 RSD 10R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD 12 

Ply Drive 

UOM: EACH

$325.00 $325.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone M726  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:  

G622 RSD

Line Item #8

10R22.5 Bridgestone R250 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Bridgestone R250 14 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$320.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  $                     325.00 GOODYEAR ENDURANCE Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:  Goodyear 

Marathon RSA G

$275.00 Endurance RSA

Line Item #9 - NO BID

10R22.5 Michelin XDE 14 Ply Drive

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Michelin XDE 14 Ply 

Drive

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements GY G622 RSD Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #10

10R22.5 Michelin XDE 12 Ply Drive

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 305.00$  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Michelin XDE 12 Ply 

Drive

UOM: EACH

$412.86 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Firestone FS 663 12PLY  $                       325.00 G622 RSD Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

M726 EL #199918

Line Item #11- MULTI-AWARD

10R22.5 Michelin XDE 14 Ply Drive

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 10R22.5 Michelin XDE 14 Ply 

Drive

UOM: EACH

$325.00 

Brand Requirements 

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  $                        325.00 G622 RSD Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Goodyear G622 

RSD G

$325.00 G622 RSD

Line Item #12

11R22.5 Bridgestone R268 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 353.00$  $                        335.00 GV ENDURANCE RSA 11R22.5 Bridgestone R268 14 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$435.51 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R268 14PLY  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

R268
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Line Item #13

11R22.5 Bridgestone R260 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Firestone FS560 14PLY  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Bridgestone R260 14 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements     $                        335.00 GY ENDURANCE  RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #14

11R22.5 Bridgestone FS560 14 Ply Steer or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 298.00$ 11R22.5 Bridgestone FS560 14 Ply 

Steer or equivalent                            

UOM: EACH

 Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Bridgestone FS560 14 

Ply Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$346.46 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements     $                        335.00 GY ENDURANCE  RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other- Goodyear

Model Number:  Goodyear 

Marathon RSA G

$280.00 Yokohama 108R #10826

Line Item #15

11R22.5 Michelin XZE2 14 Ply Steer 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Michelin XZE2 14 Ply 

Steer 

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements     $                        335.00 GY ENDURANCE  RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #16 - MULTI-AWARD

11R22.5 Goodyear G661 14 Ply Steer 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  $                        430.75 GY ENDURANCE  RSA 11R22.5 Goodyear G661 14 Ply 

Steer NOTE: G661 discontinued 

and replaced with Endurance 

RSA

UOM: EACH

$335.00 $335.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements GY ENDURANCE  RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Endurance RSA 

H

$350.00 Endurance RSA

Line Item #17

11R22.5 Bridgestone R268 16 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Bridgestone R268 16 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$447.86 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  $                        280.00 MARATHON RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

R268 16ply

Line Item #18

11R22.5 Bridgestone FS561 16 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Bridgestone FS561 16 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$265.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  $                        280.00 MARATHON RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Marathon RSS 

H

$265.00 Marathon RSS
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Line Item #19

11R22.5 Bridgestone S371 16 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Bridgestone S371 16 Ply 

Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  $                            335.00 GY ENDURANCE RSA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #20 -NO BID

11R22.5 Michelin XZE2 16 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Michelin XZE2 16 Ply 

Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #21

11R22.5 Goodyear G182 RSD 16 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 11R22.5 Goodyear G182 RSD 16 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$385.00 $280.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G622 RSD H

$335.00 Marathon RSA

Line Item #22 -NO BID

11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 14 Ply 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & 

Snow 14 Ply 

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #23 - MULTI-AWARD

11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 14 Ply 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price NA 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & 

Snow 14 Ply 

UOM: EACH

$325.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:  G622 RSD G

$325.00 G622

Line Item #24

11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 14 Ply or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & 

Snow 14 Ply or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$330.20 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Goodyear G182 

RSD H

$385.00 Yokohama TY517 MC2 #51726

4



Solicitation:

IFB-19-0004

OCSPO Tire Bid

Tredroc Tire ServicesJam Best One Fleet Service Jefferson The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company                        Belleville, 

Michigan location will service our districts.                         Akron, Ohio 
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Line Item #25 - MULTI-AWARD

11R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD Mud & Snow 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Brand Requirements G282 MSD 11R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD 

Mud & Snow 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

$325.00 $325.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Unit Price NA Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G622RSD H

$330.00 G622 RSD

Line Item #26

11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 16 Ply 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 335.00$ 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 16 

Ply   UOM: EACH

 Brand Requirements 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & 

Snow 16 Ply 

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Firestone FD663 Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #27 - MULTI-AWARD

11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 16 Ply 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & 

Snow 16 Ply 

UOM: EACH

$385.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G182RSD H

$385.00 G182 RSD

Line Item #28

11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & Snow 16 Ply or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 11R22.5 Michelin XDE Mud & 

Snow 16 Ply or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$344.99 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Yokohama TY577MC2 #57732

Line Item #29  - MULTI-AWARD

11R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD Mud & Snow 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 11R22.5 Goodyear G622 RSD 

Mud & Snow 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

$330.00 $330.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Goodyear G182 

RSD H

$385.00 G622 RSD

Line Item #30

225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 12 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 258.42$ 225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 

12 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$297.02 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R238 Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

R250F # 153028
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Line Item #31  - MULTI-AWARD

225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 12 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 

12 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

$220.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G647 RSS F

$220.00 G647 RSS

Line Item #32

225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 268.00$ 225/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 

14 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R238 Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #33 -NO BID

225/70R19.5 Michelin XZE 14 Ply Steer 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/70R19.5 Michelin XZE 14 Ply 

Steer 

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #34

225/70R19.5 Goodyear  G661 HSA #139755581 12 

Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/70R19.5 Goodyear  G661 

HSA #139755581 12 Ply Steer  

NOTE: G661 discontinued, 

replaced with G647 RSS

UOM: EACH

$220.00 No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G647 RSS G

$225.00

Line Item #35 -NO BID

225/75R16 Michelin LTX Mud & Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 0 No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #36

225/75R16 Michelin LTX Mud & Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin LTX Mud & 

Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

$124.18 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Daravis R500 HD #192659
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Line Item #37

225/75R16 Michelin LTX Mud & Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin LTX Mud & 

Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

$99.06 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other   - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Wrangler HT OL 

BSL TL E

$102.00 Firestone Transforce HT #189752

Line Item #38

225/75R16 Bridgestone R250 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Bridgestone R250 

Steer

UOM: EACH

$155.24 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Duravis R238 #002038

Line Item #39  - MULTI-AWARD

LT225/75R16 Bridgestone R250 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price LT225/75R16 Bridgestone R250 

Steer

UOM: EACH

$220.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Endurance RSA 

115/112Q E

$220.00 Endurance RSA

Line Item #40 -NO BID

225/75R16 Michelin LTX 10 Ply Steer 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin LTX 10 Ply 

Steer 

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #41

225/75R16 Goodyear G949 RSA Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Goodyear G949 RSA 

Steer NOTE: G949 discontinued 

replaced by Endurance RSA 

115/112Q E

UOM: EACH

$220.00 No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Wrangler HT OL 

BSL E

$102.00

Line Item #42 -NO BID

225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & 

Snow 10 Ply

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number: XPS

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number: XPS

Line Item #43

225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & Snow 10 Ply or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & 

Snow 10 Ply or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$114.86 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Dueler H/T #001335
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Line Item #44

225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & Snow 10 Ply or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & 

Snow 10 Ply or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$102.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Wrangler 

Fortitude HT 115R E

$106.00 Wrangler HT

Line Item #45

225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & Snow 10 Ply or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Michelin XPS Mud & 

Snow 10 Ply or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$103.90 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other -  

Goodyear

Model Number: Wrangler 

Fortitude HT 115R E

$106.00 Firestone Transforce AT2 #000180

Line Item #46 -NO BID

225/75R16 Bridgestone Duravis R500 10 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 225/75R16 Bridgestone Duravis 

R500 10 Ply Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #47

245/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 278.00$ 245/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 

Steer

UOM: EACH

$319.92 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R238 Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Bridgeston R250F

Line Item #48

245/70R19.5 Bridgestone FS560 Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 250.00$ 245/70R19.5 Bridgestone FS560 

Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$261.56 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Ffirestone FS561 12PLY Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear 

Model Number: G647 RSS 

133/131L G

$245.00 Yokohama RY023

Line Item #49

245/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 333.00$ 245/70R19.5 Bridgestone R250 

Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R268 14PLY Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:
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Line Item #50 -NO BID

245/70R19.5 Michelin XZE Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/70R19.5 Michelin XZE Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #51 - MULTI-AWARD

245/70R19.5 Goodyear 670 Steer 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/70R19.5 Goodyear 670 

Steer NOTE: Replaced with G647 

RSS 133/131L G 

UOM: EACH

$245.00 $245.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

G647 RSS

Line Item #52 -NO BID

LT245/75R16 Bridgestone R250 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price LT245/75R16 Bridgestone R250 

Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #53

LT245/75R16 Bridgestone R250 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price LT245/75R16 Bridgestone R250 

Steer

UOM: EACH

$100.49 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Endurance RSA 

E 120/116Q

$230.00 Firestone Transforce HT #189769

Line Item #54

245/75R22.5 Bridgestone R250 Steer 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R22.5 Bridgestone R250 

Steer 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

$341.44 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Bridgestone R250F

Line Item #55

245/75R22.5 Bridgestone G661 Steer 14 Ply or 

equivalent; NOTE: Goodyear G661 discontinued and 

replaced with Endurance  RSA 120/116Q E

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 330.00$ 245/75R22.5 Bridgestone G661 

Steer 14 Ply or equivalent NOTE 

Goodyear G661 discontinued 

and replaced with Endurance 

RSA 120/116Q E

UOM: EACH

$325.00 $261.11 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R268 14PLY Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Yokohama RY103
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Line Item #56 - MULTI-AWARD

245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 

Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$230.00

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Endurance RSA 

E 120/11Q

$230.00 Endurance RSA

Line Item #57 -NO BID

245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 

Steer

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #58

245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 Steer

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 

Steer

UOM: EACH

$151.37 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Model 

Number: Endurance RSA E 

120/11Q

$230.00 Firestone Destination #246998

Line Item #59

245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R16 Bridgestone R500 

Steer or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$139.15 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other  - 

Goodyear

Model Number:  G647 RSS 

133/131L G

$245.00 Bridgestone 265 V-Steel Rib #157791

Line Item #60 -NO BID

245/75R16 Michelin LTX Steer 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R16 Michelin LTX Steer 

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number: LTX

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number: LTX

Line Item #61 - MULTI-AWARD

245/75R22.5 Goodyear G661 HSA Steer 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R22.5 Goodyear G661 

HSA Steer 14 Ply  NOTE: G661 

discontinued and replaced with 

Endurance RSA G

UOM: EACH

$325.00 $325.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Endurance RSA

10



Solicitation:

IFB-19-0004

OCSPO Tire Bid

Tredroc Tire ServicesJam Best One Fleet Service Jefferson The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company                        Belleville, 

Michigan location will service our districts.                         Akron, Ohio 

is the Corporate office.

Line Item #62 -NO BID

245/75R22.5 Bridgestone R250 Steer 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 245/75R22.5 Bridgestone R250 

Steer 14 Ply

UOM: EACH

NO Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #63

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone R250 Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 333.00$ 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone R250 

Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

$457.66 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgestone R250 Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

R250ED

Line Item #64

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone ST230 Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone ST230 

Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

$265.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Marathon RSS 

H 140/137M 

$250.00 Marathon RSS

Line Item #65 -NO BID

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone R250 Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone R250 

Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

No Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #66

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone ST230 Steer 16 Ply or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone ST230 

Steer 16 Ply or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$311.52 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other  - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Marathon RSS 

H 140/137M 

$250.00 Yokohama MY507

Line Item #67 -NO BID

255/70R22.5 Michelin XZE Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Michelin XZE Steer 

16 Ply

UOM: EACH

NO Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:
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Line Item #68 - MULTI-AWARD

255/70R22.5 Goodyear G661 HSA Steer 16 Ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Goodyear G661 

HSA Steer 16 Ply NOTE G661 

discontinued, replaced by 

Endurance RSA H

UOM: EACH

$371.62 $371.62 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: Marathon RSA 

H

$265.00 Endurance RSA

Line Item #69 -NO BID

255/70R22.5 Michelin XZE Mud & Snow 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Michelin XZE Mud 

& Snow 

UOM: EACH

NO Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #70 - MULTI-AWARD

255/70R22.5 Michelin XZE Mud & Snow or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Michelin XZE Mud 

& Snow or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$320.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G622 RSA H

$320.00 G622 RSD 16ply

Line Item #71

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 

Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

$431.07 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bridgestone

Model Number:

Bridgestone M726

Line Item #72

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 Mud & Snow or 

equivalent; 16 ply

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 431.00$ 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 

Mud & Snow or equivalent; 16 

ply

UOM: EACH

$326.07 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bridgetone M726 Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: G622 RSA H

$320.00 Yokohama TY303

Line Item #73 - MULTI-AWARD

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 

Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

$320.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: G622 RSA H

$320.00 G622 RSD 16 ply
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Line Item #74 -NO BID

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 

Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

NO Bid

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Michelin

Model Number:

Line Item #75

255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Bridgestone 726 

Mud & Snow

UOM: EACH

$326.07 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Goodyear

Model Number: G622 RSA H

$320.00 Yokohama TY303

Line Item #76

10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Drive) or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 159.00$ 10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Drive) or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$150.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bandag ECL Drive Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Bandag Eclipse Drive

Line Item #77

10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Drive) or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 133.00$ 10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Drive) or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$115.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bandag BDR-AS Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear 

Model Number: Precure G167 

22

$108.00 Bandag BDR_AS

Line Item #78

10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Mud & 

Snow) 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Mud & Snow) 

UOM: EACH

$150.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Bandag Mega-Trek

Line Item #79

10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Mud & 

Snow) or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 10R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Mud & Snow) or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

$145.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Precure G167 

22

$108.00 Bandag Ultra-Drive
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Line Item #80

11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Drive)

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Drive)

UOM: EACH

$166.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Bandag Eclipse Drive

Line Item #81

11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Drive) or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 175.00$ 11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Drive) or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$160.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bandag ECL Drive Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Precure G167 

22

$122.00 Bandag Ultra-Drive

Line Item #82

11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Mud & 

Snow) 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Mud & Snow) 

UOM: EACH

$180.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Bandag BDR_AS

Line Item #83

11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Mud & 

Snow) or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 148.46$  11R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse 

Retread (Mud & Snow) or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

$160.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bandag BDR-AS Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Precure G167 

22

$122.00 Bandag Mega-Trek

Line Item #84

255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Drive) 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price  Unit Price 255/70R22.5  Retread Bandag 

Eclipse Retread (Drive)  UOM:  

EACH

$135.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Bandag Eclipse Drive
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Line Item #85

255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Drive) 

or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 153.00$ 255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag 

Eclipse Retread (Drive) or 

equivalent

UOM: EACH

$138.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Bandag ECL -Drive Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Precure G167 

22

$110.00 Bandag Mega-Trek

Line Item #86

255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Mud 

& Snow) 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 130.00$ 255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag 

Eclipse Retread (Mud & Snow) 

UOM: EACH

$138.00 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Brand Requirements  Badag BDR-as Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Bandag

Model Number:

Bandag Ultra-Drive

Line Item #87

255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag Eclipse Retread (Mud 

& Snow) or equivalent

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 255/70R22.5 Retread Bandag 

Eclipse Retread (Mud & Snow) 

or equivalent

UOM: EACH

$118.63 

Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other

Model Number:

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Manufacturer: Other - 

Goodyear

Model Number: Precure G167 

22

$110.00 Bandag BDR_AS

SERVICES  - MULTI-AWARD

Line Item #88

Recondition Wheels: Sandblast, Prime, Black Paint, 

Clear Coat Finish

UOM: EACH

Unit Price Recondition Wheels: Sandblast, 

Prime, Black Paint, Clear Coat 

Finish

UOM: EACH

$30.47 $42.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #89

Recondition Wheels: Sandblast, Prime, Powder Coat, 

Finish

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 29.00$ Recondition Wheels: Sandblast, 

Prime, Powder Coat, Finish

UOM: EACH

$30.47 $32.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item
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Line Item #90

Mount/Dismount - Large Bus Steer Tire: Remove old 

tire and replace with new tire

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 12.50$ Mount/Dismount - Large Bus 

Steer Tire: Remove old tire and 

replace with new tire

UOM: EACH

$35.05 $20.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #91

Mount/Dismount - Small Bus & Truck Tire: Remove 

old tire and replace with new tire

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 9.50$ Mount/Dismount - Small Bus & 

Truck Tire: Remove old tire and 

replace with new tire

UOM: EACH

$22.57 $16.50 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements     Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #92

Tire Repair - Various Sizes: Dismount, Patch, Plug & 

Remount

UOM: EACH

Unit Price    Tire Repair - Various Sizes: 

Dismount, Patch, Plug & 

Remount

UOM: EACH

$44.55 $30.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #93

Balancing - Large Bus Steer Tires: Wheel Weight 

Method

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 30.00$ Balancing - Large Bus Steer 

Tires: Wheel Weight Method

UOM: EACH

$20.57 $30.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #94

Balancing - Small Bus & Truck Steer Tires: Wheel 

Weight Method

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 20.00$ Balancing - Small Bus & Truck 

Steer Tires: Wheel Weight 

Method

UOM: EACH

$15.97 $25.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #95

Balancing - Large Bus Steer Tires: Powder Method

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 17.50$ Balancing - Large Bus Steer 

Tires: Powder Method

UOM: EACH

$29.99 $25.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item
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Line Item #96

Balancing - Small Bus & Truck Steer Tires: Powder 

Method

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 15.00$ Balancing - Small Bus & Truck 

Steer Tires: Powder Method

UOM: EACH

$15.97 $20.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #97

Valve Stem/Cap 16" - Flow Thru Valve Cap

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 2.00$ Valve Stem/Cap 16" - Flow Thru 

Valve Cap

UOM: EACH

$4.57 $4.25 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #98

Valve Stem/Cap 22.5" - Valve Stem/Cap 22.5"

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 4.50$ Valve Stem/Cap 22.5" - Valve 

Stem/Cap 22.5"

UOM: EACH

$6.97 $5.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #99

Scrap Tire Disposal - Light truck sizes

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 5.00$ Scrap Tire Disposal - Light truck 

sizes

UOM: EACH

$4.00 $8.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #100

Scrap Tire Disposal - Bus and large truck sizes

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 9.50$ Scrap Tire Disposal - Bus and 

large truck sizes

UOM: EACH

$4.00 $10.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #101

Service Call - Scheduled yard service

UOM: EACH

Unit Price    Service Call - Scheduled yard 

service

UOM: EACH

$75.99/hr $90.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #102

Emergency Road Service - Monday through Friday

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 90.00$ Emergency Road Service - 

Monday through Friday

UOM: EACH

$95.65/hr $105.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item
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Line Item #103

Emergency Road Service - Weekends and Holidays

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 125.00$ Emergency Road Service - 

Weekends and Holidays

UOM: EACH

$143.10/hr $135.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #104

Replacement Rims - 10R22.5 Hub Pilot

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 125.00$ Replacement Rims - 10R22.5 

Hub Pilot

UOM: EACH

$80.00 $130.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements  Brand Requirements Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #105

Replacement Rims - 11R22.5 Hub Pilot

UOM: EACH

Unit Price 85.00$ Replacement Rims - 11R22.5 

Hub Pilot

UOM: EACH

$80.00 $130.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #106

Disposal of damaged or obsolete rims - various sizes - 

Disposal of damaged or obsolete rims - various sizes

UOM: EACH

Unit Price -$ Disposal of damaged or 

obsolete rims - various sizes - 

Disposal of damaged or 

obsolete rims - various sizes

UOM: EACH

No Charge NC

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Line Item #107

Optional bi-annual bus tire condition inspection - 

Vendor must provide a written report on tire 

condition of all vehicles. 

UOM: EACH

Unit Price Optional bi-annual bus tire 

condition inspection - Vendor 

must provide a written report 

on tire condition of all vehicles. 

UOM: EACH

$69.99/hr $85.00 

Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Brand Requirements    Brand Requirements

Not Applicable - Service Item

Pricing Guarantee  Pricing Guarantee 1 year  Pricing Guarantee Firm Price for 12-months

Payment Terms / 

Discount

 Payment Terms / Discount  Payment Terms / Discount Net 30 Days

Warranty Info  Warranty Info  Warranty Info Goodyear New Tire, Goodyear Authorized 

Retread Warranty & Goodyear Service 

Parts warranty enclosed with bid 

documents

Delivery / Start Date  Delivery / Start Date  Delivery / Start Date Upon contract award

Minimum Order  Minimum Order  Minimum Order $1.00

Exceptions Taken  Exceptions Taken  Exceptions Taken No

Comments/Exceptions  Comments/Exceptions  Comments/Exceptions 
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